
19th February 2023    

Sunday Next Before Lent 

Transfiguration Sunday 


Hymns  at Eucharist :  74  , 382  ,  162 , ( 318) , 20

Psalm : 99   BCP p. 580


Thank you : to Rev. David Jones who is leading our service Today


SUNDAY	 10.00 am	 Parish Eucharist with Sunday School


MONDAY	 	 Half term so NO Parent and Toddler Group

	 2.00 pm	 Townswomen’s Guild


TUESDAY 	 	 SHROVE TUESDAY

	 11.15 am	 Mothers Union Wave of Prayer - ALL WELCOME	 

	 12.30 pm	 Shrove Tuesday Fish and Chip Lunch 

	 

WEDNESDAY	 	 ASH WEDNESDAY

	 10.00 am	 Holy Eucharist with imposition of ashes

	 10.30 am	 Food Bank ( Salvation Army )	 

	 	 	 	 

THURSDAY 	 10.30 am	 Holy Eucharist ( followed by tea / coffee ) 	 

	 1.30 pm	 Coffee , Chat and Craft group. All welcome. Bring

	 	 your crafts along and enjoy the company. Or just come

 	 	 along for the chat. 

	 6.00 pm	 Clergy Surgery - for booking baptisms, weddings, or 

	 	 anything else we can help with. 

	 	 Half term so NO Youth Club 


NEXT SUNDAY	 	 Lent 1 

	 10.00 am	 Parish Eucharist with Sunday School

	 5.00 pm	 LENT COURSE - Why Pray ? 

	 	 - try and join us. 


	 

ONLINE SERVICE EACH WEEK  can be found with the link in the weekly email or by 
searching for ‘Tawe Isaf’ on YouTube. Weekly Email :  if you wish to receive a copy of 
our weekly email you can sign up on the Parish website www.stdavidsmorriston.co.uk  

Disaster Box : thank you to all who have made donations to the Earthquake appeal.  
Donations received in the coming weeks will continue to be sent to this appeal for the 
victims of this tragedy.

Congratulations : to David and Marjorie Wainwright who are celebrated their Diamond 
Anniversary this week.  With love from us all.  

Mothering Sunday Tea and Songs of Praise : at 4 p.m. on 19th March.  Free and no 
tickets needed.  Please let Margaret Jones if you can join us.  All are very welcome. Do 
invite family and friends. 

Items for bulletin / email : if you have any news or information you would like 
included on our weekly bulletin or weekly email do let me know. 

Charity Coffee Morning : Thursday 9th March 2023 following the mid week Eucharist.  
in aid of Air Ambulance Wales.   Rather than producing tickets donations will be 
welcome on the day ( or can be given to the church wardens if you cannot attend ). 

Lent Course :  this year we will be following ‘The Prayer Course’ looking at different 
ways and teachings on prayer.  The course STARTS NEXT SUNDAY at 5 p.m. and is 
repeated on Tuesdays at 2 p.m.     DO TRY AND JOIN US. 

Thank you : to all who supported our Samaritan’s Purse ( Shoebox ) appeal at 
Christmas.  We have been told that our boxes were sent to children in South Asia.  

Home Communion : we are rebuilding the list for those wishing to receive communion 
as home each month if they cannot attend church services. Do let me know of anyone 
to be added to the list ( and that they are comfortable with visitors to the home ). 

St. David’s Day : pupils from Ysgol Tan Y Lan will be joining our morning service on 
Thursday 2nd March to share some Welsh songs with us, so we will celebrate St. 
David’s Day that day.

PCC Meeting : on Sunday 5th March at 4 p.m with Ven Peter Brookes to talk about the 
development of Ministry Areas.

Pastoral Contact : please do keep me informed of pastoral visits and calls that are 
needed as we try and keep track of everyone !   

Diocese 100th Anniversary 2023  : There are events taking place through the year 
with the main celebration on Saturday 9th September in the Royal Welsh Show-ground 
in Builth.  If you would be interested to attend please let Margaret ( Churchwarden ) 
know so we can judge if a bus needs to be booked. 

Vicar: Canon Hugh Lervy

( also Area Dean of Afon Tawe )


Tel. :  (01792) 771329

Mobile : 07976 725644


e-mail : vicar.morriston@gmail.com 
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